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Seal Coat Agreggate-Price per ton

Fisher Verplank Elmers  Rieth 2019

Vendors Transportation Trucking Co.  Riley winning bid

Item:

34CS Slag - Suttons Bay 57.78$            59.50$            No bid  No bid 43.00$         

34CS Slag - Maple City 57.78$            59.50$            No bid  No bid 40.90$         

Alternative Aggregates:

25A Slag - Suttons Bay No bid 47.50$            37.40$           43.00$         36.20$         

25A Slag - Maple City No bid 47.50$            35.40$          40.00$         34.10$         

29A Slag - Suttons Bay 55.78$            59.50$            No bid  No bid

29A Slag - Maple City 55.78$            59.50$            No bid No bid

34CS Natural - Suttons Bay 31.18$          

34CS Natural - Maple City 27.80$          

25A  Natural - Suttons Bay 28.68$          

25A  Natural - Maple City 25.30$          

Brine bids (per gallon) 

Previous

Beckman Liquid Calcium Awarded

Vendors Production, Inc Chloride Sales bid 2019

Item:

26% Calcium Chloride - spread 0.235$            * No bid 0.225$         

26% Calcium Chloride - storage 0.200$            * No bid 0.200$         

*  6,000 gal min spread-truck; 8,000 bulk load

Alternative:

38% Calcium Chloride - spread 0.688$            

38% Calcium Chloride - storage 0.658$            
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Centerline painting - Price per linear foot

MPM P.K. 2018

Vendors Wyoming, MI Contracting winning bid

Items:

    First two trips 

Mobiliation to LC - per trip 200.00$          None free then $500/ea

Waterborne-Early season-yellow 0.046$            0.042$            0.04$           

Waterborne-Late season-yellow 0.047$            0.042$            0.04$           

Waterborne-Late season-white 0.045$            0.042$            0.04$           

Thermoplastic rumble strips-white 8.50$              7.00$              

Thermoplastic snowmobile crossing No bid 67.50$            per square yard

Agreggate-Price per ton

Kasson Sand  2018

Vendors & Gravel Elmers  winning bid

Item:

22A Gravel 4.50$              4.15$               3.95$           

23A Gravel 4.50$              4.15$               

Winter Sand 6.25$              3.10$               

Alternative Bids:

22A Gravel-delivered to SB garage: 10.00$            10.35$             9.85$           

23A Gravel-delivered to SB garage: 10.00$            10.35$            

Winter Sand-delivered to SB garage: 11.75$            9.30$              
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