2021 Calcium Chloride Bid Tab
Estimated Liquid Calcium Michigan Beckman D&J Bowen Mich Paving Asphalt Sherwin Extended Total
Item Qty Unit Chloride Sales Chloride Sales| Production | Dust Control | Northern A-1| & Materlals Bit Mat Materials | P&T Products | Bit Mat Industries Gemseal | Using Low Bid
26% Calcium Chlgride, continuous spread | 110,000 Gal 30% | $0.582 No bid No bid $0.30 No bid $33,000.00]
(8500 gal. Min, lnad) 35% $0.66
26% Calcium Chlorids, into slorage 110,000 Gal 30% $0.542 No bid Na bid $0.20 No bid
(B500 gal. Min. load) 35% $0.62 $22,000.00
Provide matarial distriution only 110,000 Gal No bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid
{Using supplied malerial from athers)
2021 Emulsion/Fog Bid Tab
Item
HFRS-2 Emulsion 225,000 Gal 51.89 $1.90 No bid $425,250.00)
HFRS-2M Emulsion 225,000 Gal $2.04 $2.05 No bid $459,000.00|
CRS-2M Emulsion 225,000 Gal $2.04 $2.05 No bid $459,000.00|
CS5-1H Fog Seal 56,000 Gal $1.34 No bid No bid $75,040.00)
QTF Fog Seal 56,000 Gal $1.34 No bid No bid $75,040.00)
Alternate Emulsion options Fog Seal 56,000 Gal CQSEA $1.34 |Chiplock C$1.]  No bid $75,040.00]
2021 Crack Fill Material Bid Tab
Manufacturer Product
Craftco AR Plus Type Il 45000 Lbs No Bid No Bid | $0.4650 per Ib| No Bid
Craftco Roadsaver 221 45000 Lbs No Bid No Bid | $0.470 per b No Bid
Right Pointe RP 3405 45000 Lbs No Bid 0.70 per| No Bid No Bid
P&T Products Dura-fill 3405 45000 Lbs $0.48 per Ib| No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,600.00|
Bit-Mat K-T 1190 45000 Lbs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




