2021 Aggregate Bid Tab

Item Quantity Units
22A Gravel Pick up by LCRC TBD Ton
23A Gravel Pick up By LCRC TBD Ton
Winter Sand Pick up by LCRC TBD Ton
22A Gravel Delivered to Suttons Bay TBD Ton
23A Gravel Delivered to Suttons Bay TBD Ton
Winter sand Delivered to Suttons Bay TBD Ton

2021 Chipseal Aggregate Bid Tabs

34CS Slag Delivered to Suttons Bay 2500 Ton Ton

34CS Slag Delivered to Maple City 2500 Ton Ton
Alternate Aggregates

25A Slag Delivered to Suttons Bay 2500 Ton Ton

25A Slag Delivered to Maple City 2500 Ton Ton

29A Slag Delivered to Suttons Bay 2500 Ton Ton

29A Slag Delivered to Maple City 2500 Ton Ton

2021 Calcium Chloride Bid Tab
26% Calcium Chloride, continuous spread TBD Gal
(8500 gal. Min. load)

26% Calcium Chloride, into storage TBD Gal
(8500 gal. Min. load)

2021 Pavement Marking Tab
Waterborne- Early Season Paint (May to June)

Mobilization to Leelanau County 4 Trips Max Each
Pavt Mrkg, Waterborne, 4 inch, Yellow Appx. 149 RdMi Lft
Pavt Mrkg, Waterborne, 4 inch, White Appx. 149 RdMi Lft

Waterborne - Late Season Paint (Aug to Sept)
Pavt Mrkg, Waterborne, 4 inch, Yellow Appx. 39 RdMi Lft
Pavt Mrkg, Waterborne, 4 inch, White Appx. 39 RdMi Lft

ThermoPlastic Rumble Strips
Pavt Mrkg, Thermopl, Rumble Strip, White Appx. 550 Lft. Lft
At 3 Locations

ThermoPlastic Snowmobile Crossing
Pavt Mrkg, Thermopl, Snow Cross, Gray Appx 125 Syds Syd
At 3 Locations

Elmers
S4.45
$4.40
$5.00

$10.55

$10.50
$11.50

$49.85
$48.85

$39.85
$37.85
$46.85
$45.85

Rieth-Riley
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

$39.90
$37.90
No Bid
No Bid

Kasson Sand
and Gravel
$5.25
$5.25
$7.25
$11.00
$11.00
$13.00

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Verplank
Trucking
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$60.00
$60.00

$48.00
$48.00
$60.00
$60.00

Note: Verplank Trucking Bid arrived late at 1:12 PM

Fisher
Transportation
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$57.78
$57.78

No Bid
No Bid
$55.78
$55.78

Beckman
Production

No Bid

No Bid

PK
Contracting

$100.000
$0.045
$0.044

$0.045
$0.044

$6.500

$63.000

Michigan
Pavement
Marking

$250.000
$0.048
$0.049

$0.050
$0.050

$15.000

No Bid



